
 

Viasat Inc.  
Supplemental Adjusted Combined Financial Information (Unaudited) 

On May 30, 2023, Viasat, Inc. (Viasat) purchased all of the issued and outstanding shares of Connect 
Topco Limited, a private company limited by shares and incorporated in Guernsey (Inmarsat Holdings), in 
exchange for approximately $550.7 million in cash and 46.36 million shares of Viasat common stock (the 
Inmarsat Acquisition). The results of operations of the Inmarsat business are included in Viasat’s 
consolidated financial statements for the period following the closing of the Inmarsat Acquisition.   

To assist investors in evaluating Viasat’s historical and comparative financial performance to prior 
and future periods and to market trends, Viasat is providing unaudited supplemental adjusted combined 
financial information that shows, for illustrative purposes only, certain financial information of Viasat for 
the fiscal year ended March 31, 2023 and the fiscal quarters ended March 31, 2023 and June 30, 2023 
on an adjusted combined basis. This supplemental information has been prepared by combining Viasat’s 
results of operations from continuing operations for the periods presented with the results of operations of 
Inmarsat Holdings and its subsidiaries (collectively, Inmarsat) for periods prior to the closing of the 
Inmarsat Acquisition on May 30, 2023, together with certain adjustments and reclassifications to reflect 
purchase price accounting, to conform Inmarsat’s results of operations (which are reported in accordance 
with International Financial Reporting Standards (IFRS)) to US GAAP, and to conform to the presentation 
of Viasat’s historical financial information. This adjusted combined financial information is unaudited, does 
not include pro forma adjustments to reflect the Inmarsat Acquisition and related transactions, and does 
not purport to be indicative of what the combined company’s results of operations would have been if the 
Inmarsat Acquisition and related transactions had occurred at the beginning of the periods presented. 
Viasat and Inmarsat have different fiscal years, and therefore Inmarsat’s results for the twelve-month 
period ended March 31, 2023 were derived by subtracting Inmarsat’s historical results of operations for 
the three months ended March 31, 2022 from its historical results of operations for the year ended 
December 31, 2022, and adding Inmarsat’s historical results of operations for the three months ended 
March 31, 2023. In addition, the adjustments to arrive to the combined financial information do not reflect 
non-recurring charges incurred in connection with the Inmarsat Acquisition (other than to the extent 
already reflected in actual historical results), nor any cost savings and synergies that have resulted and 
are expected to result from the Inmarsat Acquisition (and associated costs to achieve such savings or 
synergies), nor any costs associated with severance, restructuring or integration activities resulting from 
the Inmarsat Acquisition.  

This supplemental adjusted combined financial information also includes a presentation of combined 
Adjusted EBITDA, which is a non-GAAP financial measure that Viasat believes is appropriate to enhance 
an overall understanding of its past financial performance and prospects for the future. Viasat believes 
Adjusted EBITDA provides useful information to both management and investors by excluding specific 
expenses that Viasat believes are not indicative of its or Inmarsat’s core operating results. Further, 
Adjusted EBITDA is a measure of operating performance used by management, as well as industry 
analysts, to evaluate operations and operating performance. In addition, since Viasat has historically 
reported non-GAAP results to the investment community, Viasat believes the inclusion of non-GAAP 
numbers provides consistency in financial reporting and facilitates comparisons to Viasat’s historical 
operating results. The presentation of this additional information is not meant to be considered in isolation 
or as a substitute for measures of financial performance prepared in accordance with US GAAP or IFRS.  

This supplemental adjusted combined financial information is provided for illustrative purposes only 
and should be read in conjunction with: (1) Viasat’s consolidated financial statements and notes thereto 
filed with the Securities and Exchange Commission, and (2) the consolidated financial statements of 
Inmarsat Holdings for the year ended December 31, 2022, the unaudited condensed financial statements 
of Inmarsat Holdings for the three months ended March 31, 2023 and the unaudited pro forma condensed 
combined financial information of Viasat for the year ended March 31, 2023 attached to Viasat’s Current 
Report on Form 8-K/A filed with the Securities and Exchange Commission on May 26, 2023.



 

 
  



 

 


